
 

 
 

Day 1: Arrival at Leh 
 
After your early morning flight has brought you to the beautiful city of Leh, our 
representatives will escort you out of the Kushok Bakula Rinpoche (KBR) Airport 
transfer to your hotel. Once you have checked into your room you have the remainder 
of the day at your own leisure. We recommend you use this time to get acclimatized 
to the high altitude and low air pressure in Ladakh. Evening can be utilized for a short 
walk to local markets. Return to your hotel for overnight stay.  

 
 
Day 2: Leh to Sham Valley return to Leh 
 
After breakfast you will drive towards bank of Indus River till Sangam. Where the 
conflicts of Zanskar river and Indus River. Drive along the Indus river visiting, Pathar 
Sahib Gurdwara and Magnetic Hill (where the cars defy gravity), and further on to Leh 
Hall of Fame (which has a museum of the Kargil War memorabilia) Also visit Spituk 
Monastery. Dinner and Overnight stay at the hotel. 

 
 
Day 3: Leh to Pangong Lake return to Leh 
 
After an early breakfast we leave for Pangong Lake through Changla pass 5486 Mtrs. 
The long easy ascent takes you to Changla pass through its winding roads passing 
through Sakti Village. Stop at the Changla Pass for a quick photograph session and 
drive down to the village of Tangtse, where you can relax for a cup of tea. Leaving 
Tangtse for Pangong you pass through few small villages of Changthang and finally 
you can have a sudden view of the Pangong Lake situated at 14,000 feet (4,267 m). 
This famous blue brackish Lake of Pangong is 5/6 Kms wide and over 133 Kms long 
with half of its running the other side of the "INDO CHINA BORDER". One rarely feels 
so close to nature and environment and the scenery is unforgettable. After spending 
some time at Pangong We drive back to Leh in the late afternoon. Overnight at Hotel 
in Leh. 



 
 
Day 4: Leh to Khardung La Top return to Leh 
 
Post Breakfast we drive to Khardung La (The Highest Motor able Road in the World) 
at 5,602 Mtrs. 18,390 Ft, around 39 km from Leh.  From the pass, one can see all the 
way south over the Indus valley to seemingly endless peaks and ridges of the Zanskar 
range, and north to the giants of the Saser massif. The views from the top of the pass 
are amazing. Return to the hotel & later you can stroll around the market place for 
some last-minute souvenir shopping. Dinner & Overnight at hotel. 

 
 
Day 5: Departure from Leh 
 
After breakfast leave from hotel & drive to Leh Airport for onwards destination. 

 

Come home with beautiful Memories ! 

  


